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MUNICIPALITY OF THE COUNTY OF ANNAPOLIS
RESULTS OF
MARCH 1, 2017 TAX SALE

PROPERTY SOLD
Brandon Caldwell & Kimberly Caldwell
1105-831-849

Rebecca Canning & Neil Wilson
604-966-406

Janet S Dunn Est of
801-340-425

Daryle Tayler Vernon Ehnes & Diana Marie Wheeler

805-028-086

Glenn's Parcel Service (2004) Limited
610-126-126

Valerie Goldin & Katrina Leanne Hockey
1002-458-071

Valerie Roma Goldin & Katrina Leanne Hockey
1107-013-248

Walter E Haynes Jr Est of
502-569-434

Lawrence Davies Hicks Est of
309-154-116

Kevin Kaulbach & Marion Susan Kaulbach et al
302-201-321

Joseph Daniel Landry & Lorraine Landry
102-994-267

Norbert C LeBlanc
302-500-337

Marshall L Lewis
507-008-732

Kevin Tracey McKaigue & Frank Elwood Noble
309-553-479

Thomas Cameron Morrison
801-340-433

Alan Richard Myatt
1001-651-978

Alan Richard Myatt
1003-490-602

Berndt Rene Ruff
207-027-249

Michael S Stanley
404-411-161

Alden G Walker Est of
704-786-726

PURCHASER(S) NAME PROPERTY TAXES, INTERESTSUCCESSFUL SURPLUS  AMOUNT HST AMOUNT OWING
DESCRIPTION AND EXPENSES BID PAID (Due March 6/17)
Parsons Investments Ltd. 1974 Premier Mobile $1,205.14 $1,205.14 $0.00 $1,205.14 $0.00 $0.00
27 Richardson Dr - Meadowvale
Azar Antoun Hakim Land Building $1,999.67 $3,600.00 $1,600.33 $1,999.67 $0.00 $1,600.33
Jennifer S Halliday 56 Guinea Rd - Guinea
Azar Antoun Hakim Land $1,863.33 $2,000.00 $136.67 $2,000.00 $300.00 $300.00
Jennifer S Halliday Old Trunk 8 - Lequille
Douglas Gordon Potter Land $1,003.07 $1,400.00 $396.93 $1,610.00 $210.00 $0.00
Dunn Rd - Waldeck
NO BID Service $9,519.56
121 Sherman Street - Lot 07-2 Cornwallis Park
Michael Anthony Gaul Land $1,402.89 $5,600.00 $4,197.11 $6,440.00 $840.00 $0.00
Pamela May Matheson Gaul Inglisville Rd - West Inglisville
Hans Edward Krauch Land $1,566.14 $6,000.00 $4,433.86 $6,900.00 $900.00 $0.00
McGinty Rd - Lot G Torbrook
Julian Anthony Colaluca Land $2,270.55 $1,600.00 $0.00 $1,840.00 $240.00 $0.00
Deborah A Archer Victoria Beach Rd - Victoria Beach
Municipality of the County of Annapolis Land $1,760.53 $1,760.53 $0.00 $2,024.61 $264.08 $0.00
Church Street - Bridgetown North
Ricky Gerald Balsor Land Res/Com Mix $10,931.54 $10,931.54 $0.00 $12,571.27 $1,639.73 $0.00
267 Granville Street West - Bridgetown
NO BID Land Dwelling Building $2,817.59
41 Station Rd - Wilmot
NO BID Land Dwelling $2,505.51
Arlington Rd - Arlington West
Scott B Hebb Land $915.72 $5,200.00 $4,284.28 $5,980.00 $780.00 $0.00
Parker Mountain Rd - Parkers Cove
Dale W Young Land $916.89 $2,100.00 $1,183.11 $916.89 $315.00 $1,498.11
Wayne B Young Phinney Mountain Rd - Beaconsfield
John A Hurlburt Land $934.01 $5,000.00 $4,065.99 $5,750.00 $750.00 $0.00
Clementsvale Rd - Lequille
John Douglas Gates Dwelling $2,957.98 $6,100.00 $3,142.02 $4,612.61 $0.00 $1,487.39
Jill Louise Rafuse 5243 Highway 10 - Lot 94-1 New Albany
NO BID Land $1,009.02
Highway 10 - Albany
David L Boates Jr Margaretsville Rd $1,654.63 $18,000.00 $16,345.37  $20,700.00 $2,700.00 $0.00
Mary Elizabeth Best Lot 7 Margaretsville
Barry McGuigan Land $14,401.78 $14,401.78 $0.00 $16,562.05 $2,160.27 $0.00
Kevin McGuigan Round Hill Rd - Round Hill
Lawrence L Emery Land $1,044.01 $2,400.00 $1,355.99 $2,760.00 $360.00 $0.00
Donna Roseane Crossland Highway 201 - Centrelea
$62,679.56 $87,298.99  $41,141.66 $93,872.24 $11,459.08 $4,885.83

S. Hudson



